Reminder that we will need to have the Commissioners approve another 1GT on or before
June 17.

Thank you.
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--- Original message ---

Subject: FW: Anchor Update - 5/17/19 IGT estimated

From: <dhaehn@ccmhospital.com>

To: Danja Bloodworth <claycoap@co.clay.tx.us>, Gina Blevins
<gina.blevins@co.clay.tx.us>, <dannielle.moore@co.clay.tx.us>, Mike Campbell
<Mike.Campbell@co.clay.tx.us>

Cc: Jeff AHuskey <jhuskey@ccmhos ital.com>

Date: Friday, 05/17/2019 3:18 PM

Judge Campbell, Jeff, Gina, Danja,
This email notifies us of an IGT due on June 17.

The amounts are not definite, but I see $58,095.22 on the DSRIP bulletin board for
Clay County Memorial Hospital.
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